
LIEBHERR R945 056625-1866 - GREASESample No: LH0282825
Oil Type: {unknown}

SINTRA INC. DIVISION OUEST499 CHEMIN FORETST-PAUL, QCCA  J0K 3E0Contact: Service Managerjonathan.smith@sintra.caT: F: 
Diagnosis
Il s`agit du relevé de base del`échantillon soumis.  Please contactus at 1-800-268-2131 and submit aPurchase Order for GRS-1 analysis($195 + HST).{sans objet} {sans objet}{sans objet}

Depot: SIN499STPUnique No: 5759008Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 15 Apr 2024
Report Id: SIN499STP [WCAMIS] 02625876 (Generated: 04/19/2024 09:30:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - SIN499STP

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0282825 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Mar 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 938 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIN499STP [WCAMIS] 02625876 (Generated: 04/19/2024 09:30:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - SIN499STP
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR R945 056625-1866\Grease [LH0282825] 31 Mar 2024 @ 938.0 hrs

