
[CNRL] 2210 - Diesel Fuel
Sample No: LH0265169

Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)

Liebherr-Canada Ltd.

Fort McKay Industrial Park, Lot No. 12 and 13

Fort McMurray, AB

CA  T9H 5N3

Contact: Corey Ekroth

corey.ekroth@liebherr.com

T: (780)791-2967

F: 

Diagnosis
Please contact your representative

for information regarding the proper

sampling kits for your service.{not

applicable} There is no indication of

any contamination in the

component(unconfirmed). Not

enough sample submitted to

determine fuel condition and/or

classification.

Depot: LIEFTM

Unique No: 5803207

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 05 Jul 2024

Report Id: LIEFTM [WCAMIS] 02645668 (Generated: 07/05/2024 17:06:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane Division - Corey Ekroth - LIEFTM

 Sample Information
Sample Number LH0265169 --- --- ---

Sample Date 26 Jun 2024 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 25320 --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 Fuel Condition
Sulfur ppm 5 --- --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.9 --- --- ---

 Contamination
Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 Graphs

Report Id: LIEFTM [WCAMIS] 02645668 (Generated: 07/05/2024 17:06:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Crane Division - Corey Ekroth - LIEFTM

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR 2210\Diesel Fuel [LH0265169] 26 Jun 2024 @ 25320.0 hrs

