
LIEBHERR L546 054052-1560 - Front Left Wheel Hub
Sample No: LH0169006

Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

MOOREFIELD EXCAVATING LTD.

6297 WELLINGTON RD. 109S, RR #3

HARRISTON, ON

CA  N0G 1Z0

Contact: John Landman

info@moorefieldex.ca

T: (519)343-3571

F: (519)510-3277

Diagnosis
The oil change at the time of

sampling has been noted. We

recommend an early resample to

monitor this condition.Iron ppm levels

are abnormal. The low ferrous

density (PQ) index indicates the wear

metal levels are due to corrosion.

There is no indication of any

contamination in the oil. The oil is no

longer serviceable as a result of the

abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: MOOPAL

Unique No: 5812306

Signed: Kevin Marson

Report Date: 10 Jul 2024

Report Id: MOOPAL [WCAMIS] 02646754 (Generated: 07/10/2024 16:21:58) Rev: 2 Submitted By: ?

 Sample Information
Sample Number LH0169006 LH0169032 LH0169019 LH0168993

Sample Date 11 Jun 2024 10 Jan 2023 15 Sep 2022 14 Jun 2021

Machine Hours 7137 4988 4420 2095

Oil Hours 0 0 0 0

Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Changed

Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL

 Oil Condition
Visc @ 40°C cSt 109 122 122 106

 Contamination
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEG

Silicon ppm <1 5 1 8

Sodium ppm 2 2 2 2

Potassium ppm 4 5 4 <1

 Wear Metals
PQ 0 0 0 ---

Iron ppm 528 769 494 54

Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1

Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1

Tin ppm 0 0 0 0

Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 <1

Chromium ppm 6 9 6 <1

Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 <1

Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 <1

Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0

Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1

Manganese ppm 3 6 4 1

Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0

 Additives
Calcium ppm 12 8 6 18

Magnesium ppm 6 <1 <1 1

Zinc ppm 12 14 12 12

Phosphorus ppm 582 835 706 1127

Barium ppm 0 0 0 <1

Boron ppm 3 6 5 7

Page 1 of 2



 Graphs

Report Id: MOOPAL [WCAMIS] 02646754 (Generated: 07/10/2024 16:22:00) Rev: 2 Submitted By: ?

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR L546 054052-1560\Front Left Wheel Hub [LH0169006] 11 Jun 2024 @ 7137.0 hrs

