
LIEBHERR LH60 107739-1217 - Diesel Fuel
Sample No: LH0200125

Oil Type: {unknown}

FINKBINER EQUIPMENT CO.

15 W 400 N FRONTAGE RD

BURR RIDGE, IL

US  60527

Contact: DON FITZGERALD

dfitzgerald@finkbiner.com

T: (815)546-8991

F: (630)654-3792

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended

at this time.All metal levels are

normal indicating no corrosion in the

cooling system. The water content is

negligible. There is no indication of

any contamination in the fuel.

Depot: LEC0033

Unique No: 9720499

Signed: Jonathan Hester

Report Date: 02 Nov 2021

Report Id: LEC0033 [WUSCAR] 05386366 (Generated: 04/01/2024 10:07:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON FITZGERALD - LEC0033

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0200125 LH0190712 --- ---

Sample Date 24 Sep 2021 21 Jun 2021 --- ---

Machine Hours 5121 4358 --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---

 FUEL CONDITION
Sulfur ppm 6 5 --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.89 2.68 --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % 0.003 0.003 --- ---

Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---

Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---

Aluminum ppm 0 0 --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---

Silicon ppm 0 <1 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEC0033 [WUSCAR] 05386366 (Generated: 04/01/2024 10:07:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON FITZGERALD - LEC0033

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH60 107739-1217\Diesel Fuel [LH0200125] 24 Sep 2021 @ 5121.0 hrs

