
[[AZCON]] LIEBHERR A934 038332-1006 - Diesel Fuel
Sample No: LH0253878

Oil Type: NOT GIVEN

AMERICAN STATE EQUIPMENT CO.

2400 NORTH 14TH AVENUE

WAUSAU, WI

US  54401

Contact: CHRIS BARTNIK

cbartnik@amstate.com

T: (715)675-6900

F: (715)675-9748

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended

at this time.All metal levels are

normal indicating no corrosion in the

system. The water content is

negligible. There is no indication of

any contamination in the fuel. The

condition of the fuel is acceptable for

the time in service.

Depot: LEC0008

Unique No: 10635582

Signed: Doug Bogart

Report Date: 11 Sep 2023

Report Id: LEC0008 [WUSCAR] 05944970 (Generated: 09/12/2023 08:40:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BARTNIK - LEC0008

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0253878 --- --- ---

Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 13950 --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 FUEL CONDITION
Sulfur ppm 6 --- --- ---

Visc @ 40°C cSt 1.76 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Water % 0.004 --- --- ---

Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEC0008 [WUSCAR] 05944970 (Generated: 09/12/2023 08:40:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BARTNIK - LEC0008

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR A934 038332-1006\Diesel Fuel [LH0253878] 11 Aug 2023 @ 13950.0 hrs

