
LINKBELT N8X1001 - Left Final Drive
Sample No: LH0267654

Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90

OZINGA MATERIALS

11701 S TORRENCE AVE

CHICAGO, IL

US  60617

Contact: RYAN DEWINDT

ryandewindt@ozinga.com

T: (708)243-6910

F: (773)375-7226

Diagnosis
The oil change at the time of

sampling has been noted. No

corrective action is recommended at

this time. Resample at the next

service interval to monitor.All

component wear rates are normal.

Elemental level of silicon (Si) above

normal. The condition of the oil is

acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CHICHILH

Unique No: 10701180

Signed: Don Baldridge

Report Date: 21 Oct 2023

Report Id: CHICHILH [WUSCAR] 05983885 (Generated: 10/22/2023 13:30:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN DEWINDT - CHICHILH

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0267654 --- --- ---

Sample Date 03 Oct 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 19078 --- --- ---

Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---

Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---

 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 142 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Silicon ppm 75 --- --- ---

Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---

Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---

 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 131 --- --- ---

Copper ppm 12 --- --- ---

Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---

Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---

Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---

Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---

Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---

Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---

Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 44 --- --- ---

Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---

Phosphorus ppm 348 --- --- ---

Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Boron ppm 21 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHICHILH [WUSCAR] 05983885 (Generated: 10/22/2023 13:30:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN DEWINDT - CHICHILH

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LINKBELT LINKBELT N8X1001\Left Final Drive [LH0267654] 03 Oct 2023 @ 19078.0 hrs

