
LINKBELT N8X1001 - Coolant
Sample No: LH0267651

Oil Type: HYBRID (HOAT) COOLANT

OZINGA MATERIALS

11701 S TORRENCE AVE

CHICAGO, IL

US  60617

Contact: RYAN DEWINDT

ryandewindt@ozinga.com

T: (708)243-6910

F: (773)375-7226

Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for further

service. There is no indication of any

contamination in the coolant. The

carboxylate level of this fluid is

acceptable. The glycol level is

acceptable. The pH level of this fluid

is within the acceptable limits.

Depot: CHICHILH

Unique No: 10701292

Signed: Jonathan Hester

Report Date: 24 Oct 2023

Report Id: CHICHILH [WUSCAR] 05983997 (Generated: 10/27/2023 02:02:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN DEWINDT - CHICHILH

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number LH0267651 --- --- ---

Sample Date 03 Oct 2023 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 19078 --- --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---

 COOLANT CONDITION
pH Scale 0-14 8.23 --- --- ---

Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---

Nitrites ppm 676 --- --- ---

Percentage Glycol % 54.9 --- --- ---

Freezing Point °C -45 --- --- ---

 CONTAMINATION
Coolant Appearance normal --- --- ---

Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHICHILH [WUSCAR] 05983997 (Generated: 10/27/2023 02:02:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN DEWINDT - CHICHILH

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LINKBELT LINKBELT N8X1001\Coolant [LH0267651] 03 Oct 2023 @ 19078.0 hrs

