
LIEBHERR A934C 065595-1007 - Rear Differential
Sample No: LH0267146

Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90

DOMTAR PULP AND PAPER

301 POINT BASSE AVE

NEKOOSA, WI

US  54457

Contact: MARK SNYDER

mark.snyder@domtar.com

T: (715)675-6900

F: (715)675-9748

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended

at this time. We recommend an early

resample to monitor this

condition.Bearing and/or gear wear is

indicated. There is no indication of

any contamination in the oil. The

condition of the oil is acceptable for

the time in service.

Depot: DOMWAU

Unique No: 11004495

Signed: Don Baldridge

Report Date: 01 May 2024

Report Id: DOMWAU [WUSCAR] 06163776 (Generated: 05/02/2024 08:46:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK SNYDER - DOMWAU

 Sample Information
Sample Number LH0267146 --- --- ---

Sample Date 18 Apr 2024 --- --- ---

Machine Hours 55376 --- --- ---

Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---

Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---

 Oil Condition
Visc @ 40°C cSt 99.5 --- --- ---

 Contamination
Water % NEG --- --- ---

Silicon ppm 20 --- --- ---

Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---

Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---

 Wear Metals
Iron ppm 361 --- --- ---

Copper ppm 141 --- --- ---

Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---

Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---

Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---

Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---

Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---

Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---

Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---

Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---

Manganese ppm 6 --- --- ---

Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---

 Additives
Calcium ppm 1117 --- --- ---

Magnesium ppm 10 --- --- ---

Zinc ppm 484 --- --- ---

Phosphorus ppm 1903 --- --- ---

Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---

Boron ppm 33 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 Graphs

Report Id: DOMWAU [WUSCAR] 06163776 (Generated: 05/02/2024 08:46:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK SNYDER - DOMWAU

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR A934C 065595-1007\Rear Differential [LH0267146] 18 Apr 2024 @ 55376.0 hrs

