
LIEBHERR LH50 1216-123739 - Front Left Wheel Hub
Sample No: LH0211715

Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 75W90

AHLSTROM-MUNKSJO NA SPECIALTY

PO BOX 600

KAUKAUNA, WI

US  54130

Contact: JOE SEITZ

joe.seiltz@ahlstrom-munksjo.com

T: 

F: 

Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommended

at this time. Resample at the next

service interval to monitor.Gear wear

is indicated. All other component

wear rates are normal. There is no

indication of any contamination in the

oil. The condition of the oil is

acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: AHLKAU

Unique No: 11097167

Signed: Don Baldridge

Report Date: 26 Jun 2024

Report Id: AHLKAU [WUSCAR] 06218970 (Generated: 06/29/2024 19:57:38) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

 Sample Information
Sample Number LH0211715 LH0211687 LH0211645 LH0211631

Sample Date 17 Jun 2024 31 Jan 2024 28 Mar 2023 18 Jan 2023

Machine Hours 12322 10743 7200 6180

Oil Hours 0 0 0 0

Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd

Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL

 Oil Condition
Visc @ 40°C cSt 101 106 136 142

 Contamination
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEG

Silicon ppm 14 13 21 17

Sodium ppm 14 9 15 10

Potassium ppm 4 <1 2 1

 Wear Metals
Iron ppm 609 443 427 217

Copper ppm 18 14 29 64

Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1

Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1

Aluminum ppm 2 <1 3 4

Chromium ppm 1 <1 2 1

Molybdenum ppm 0 0 2 2

Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1

Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1

Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0

Manganese ppm 6 4 6 5

Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0

 Additives
Calcium ppm 124 97 236 206

Magnesium ppm 2 2 5 2

Zinc ppm 68 46 96 96

Phosphorus ppm 2308 2017 1982 1873

Barium ppm 0 0 0 3

Boron ppm 110 187 21 15

Page 1 of 2



 Graphs

Report Id: AHLKAU [WUSCAR] 06218970 (Generated: 06/29/2024 19:57:41) Rev: 1 Submitted By: ?

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH50 1216-123739\Front Left Wheel Hub [LH0211715] 17 Jun 2024 @ 12322.0 hrs

