
Sample Rating TrendNORMAL

OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

K604
Component

Natural Gas Compression Engine
Fluid

PETRO CANADA SENTRON LD 3000 (--- LTR)

Report Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02644798 (Generated: 07/04/2024 12:27:39) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Nolan Jenkins

S
a
m

p
le

N
u
m

b
e
r

PC0089490

PC0089510

PC0089475

PC0089503

PC0085503

PC0085488

S
a
m

p
le

D
a
te

21 Jun 2024

15 May 2024

11 Apr 2024

27 Mar 2024

16 Feb 2024

17 Jan 2024

 Sample

Ir
o
n

>14

2

2

2

1

1

1

C
h
ro

m
iu

m

>3

0

0

0

0

0

0

N
ic

k
e
l

>5

<1

0

0

0

0

<1

T
it
a
n
iu

m

0

0

0

0

0

0
S

ilv
e
r

>5

0

0

0

0

<1

0

A
lu

m
in

u
m

>5

1

1

1

1

1

1

L
e
a
d

>8

5

2

2

1

2

2

C
o
p
p
e
r

>5

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

T
in

>3

0

0

0

0

0

0

A
n
ti
m

o
n
y

0

0

0

0

0

0

V
a
n
a
d
iu

m

0

0

0

0

0

0

B
e
ry

lli
u
m

0

0

0

0

0

0

C
a
d
m

iu
m

0

0

0

0

0

0

 Wear Metals

S
ili

c
o
n

>180

<1

0

0

0

<1

<1

S
o
d
iu

m

>20

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

P
o
ta

s
s
iu

m

>20

<1

0

0

<1

<1

1

 Contaminants

B
o
ro

n

5

1

1

1

1

1

1

B
a
ri
u
m

1

0

0

0

0

0

0

M
o

ly
b

d
e

n
u

m

2

<1

0

0

0

<1

<1

M
a
n
g
a
n
e
s
e

1

0

0

0

0

0

0

M
a
g
n
e
s
iu

m

5

8

9

8

7

7

7

C
a
lc

iu
m

1220

1368

1361

1342

1310

1292

1272

P
h

o
s
p

h
o

ru
s

298

272

279

269

265

269

270

Z
in

c

350

348

342

330

322

316

312

S
u
lf
u
r

1995

2104

2103

2035

2003

2146

2186

L
it
h
iu

m

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

<1

 Additives

S
a
m

p
le

N
u
m

b
e
r

PC0089490

PC0089510

PC0089475

PC0089503

PC0085503

PC0085488

M
a
c
h
in

e

A
g
e

hrs

10306

0

8610

8051

7307

6606

O
il 

A
g
e

hrs

0

0

0

7307

0

0

O
il

C
h
a
n
g
e
d

Not Changd

N/A

Not Changd

N/A

Not Changd

Not Changd

F
ilt

e
r

C
h
a
n
g
e
d

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

 Sample

V
is

c
 @

4
0
°C

124.3

125

122

121

121

119

119

V
is

c
 @

1
0
0
°C

13.7

13.4

13.3

13.4

13.2

13.2

13.2

V
is

c
o
s
it
y

In
d
e
x
 (

V
I)

106

101

103

106

103

105

105

W
a
te

r

>0.1

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

G
ly

c
o
l

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

NEG

F
u
e
l

>4.0

<1.0

<1.0

<1.0

<1.0

<1.0

<1.0

 Physical Tests

O
xi

da
tio

n(
D

iff
)

< 25

11.4

9.3

8.4

7

6.1

4.2

N
itr

a
tio

n
(D

iff
)

< 25

6.6

5.8

5.2

4.9

4.6

3.4

S
u

lfa
tio

n
(D

iff
)

9.6

8.4

7.2

5.8

5.4

3.6

A
c
id

 N
u
m

b
e
r

(A
N

)

0.86

1.99

1.81

1.33

1.57

0.60

0.20

B
a

s
e

N
u

m
b

e
r 

(B
N

)

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

P
a
rt

ic
le

s

>
4
µ
m

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

P
a
rt

ic
le

s

>
6
µ
m

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

P
a
rt

ic
le

s

>
1
4
µ
m

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

O
il

C
le

a
n
lin

e
s
s

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

---

 Other Tests

 Recommendations  Interpretation

21 Jun 2024

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

21 Jun 2024

All component wear rates are normal. There is no indication of any contamination

in the oil. The AN level is acceptable for this fluid. The condition of the oil is suitable

for further service.

15 May 2024

Resample at the next service interval to monitor.

15 May 2024

All component wear rates are normal. There is no indication of any contamination

in the oil. The AN level is acceptable for this fluid. The condition of the oil is suitable

for further service.

Page 1 of 2



Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : PC0089490

Lab Number : 02644798

Unique Number : 5802337

Test Package : GEO 2 ( Additional Tests: TAN Man )

Received : 02 Jul 2024

Tested : 02 Jul 2024

Diagnosed : 04 Jul 2024 - Bill Quesnel

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

NuVista Energy

10508 67 Ave, #201

Grande Prairie, AB

CA  T8W 0K8

Contact: Eldon Weaver

eweaver@nvaenergy.com

T: 

F: 

Report Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02644798 (Generated: 07/04/2024 12:27:39) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Nolan Jenkins

 Charts & Pictures

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5802337-4313518&lid=5802337&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR K604\Natural Gas Compression Engine [PC0089490] 21 Jun 2024 @ 10306.0 hrs

