
Sample Rating TrendNORMAL

OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

K602
Component

Natural Gas Compression Engine
Fluid

PETRO CANADA SENTRON LD 3000 (--- LTR)

Report Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02613136 (Generated: 04/02/2024 16:01:13) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Kris Dickmann

Page 1 of 2



Laboratory : WearCheck - C8-1175 Appleby Line, Burlington, ON L7L 5H9

Sample No. : PC0085494

Lab Number : 02613136

Unique Number : 5722231

Test Package : PLANT ( Additional Tests: FT-IR, FT-IR(Diff), KV100, TAN Man, VI )

Received : 02 Feb 2024

Tested : 05 Feb 2024

Diagnosed : 05 Feb 2024 - Bill Quesnel

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-268-2131.

Test denoted (*) outside scope of accreditation, (m) method modified, (e) tested at external lab.

Validity of results and interpretation are based on the sample and information as supplied.

NuVista Energy

10508 67 Ave, #201

Grande Prairie, AB

CA  T8W 0K8

Contact: Eldon Weaver

eweaver@nvaenergy.com

T: 

F: 

Report Id: NUVGRA [WCAMIS] 02613136 (Generated: 04/02/2024 16:01:13) Rev: 1 Submitted By: Kris Dickmann

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-5722231-4313517&lid=5722231&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR K602\Natural Gas Compression Engine [PC0085494] 17 Jan 2024 @ 31640.0 hrs

