
901148 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)Sample No: GFL0111770
Oil Type: DEXRON III

GFL Environmental - 557 - Edson6615 - 4th Ave,Edson, ABCA  T7E 1M5Contact: GFL Techwcgfldemo@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DEXRON III.  Please confirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: GFL557Unique No: 5773979Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 02 May 2024
Report Id: GFL557 [WCAMIS] 02632826 (Generated: 06/09/2024 17:34:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GFL Tech - GFL557

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number GFL0111770 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9413 --- --- ---Oil Hours 3100 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 40°C cSt 31.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 138 --- --- ---Copper ppm 42 --- --- ---Lead ppm 10 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 54 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 84 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 7 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 232 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GFL557 [WCAMIS] 02632826 (Generated: 06/09/2024 17:34:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GFL Tech - GFL557
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	MACK 901148\Transmission (Auto) [GFL0111770] 13 Apr 2024 @ 9413.0 hrs

