
Sample Rating Trend

NORMALOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

slider press Crowncork seal
Component

Circulating System
Fluid

PETRO CANADA PURITY FG WHITE OIL 15 (--- GAL)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

 Debris appears to be metal shavings and organic

material similar to wax. Suspect build up is

accumulation of metal particles from the

manufacturing process combined with the oil

protectant. Debris is highly magnetic and partially

flammable.

Report Id: YVEWAU [WUSCAR] 05933046 (Generated: 09/19/2023 15:41:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: YVETTE TRZCINSKI - YVEWAU

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info PCA05933046 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 22 Aug 2023 --- ---

Machine Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age hrs Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status NORMAL --- ---

 SAMPLE IMAGES method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

PrtFilter no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



OIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : PCA05933046

Lab Number : 05933046

Unique Number : 10618317

Test Package : TEST ( Additional Tests: FilterPatch, KF )

Received : 23 Aug 2023

Diagnosed : 19 Sep 2023

Diagnostician : Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

YVETTE TRZCINSKI

850 WESTBROOKE PKWY

WAUKESHA, WI

US  53186

Contact: YVETTE TRZCINSKI

yvette.trzcinski@hfsinclair.com

T: 

F: 

Report Id: YVEWAU [WUSCAR] 05933046 (Generated: 09/19/2023 15:41:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: YVETTE TRZCINSKI - YVEWAU

 GRAPHS

Report Id: YVEWAU [WUSCAR] 05933046 (Generated: 09/19/2023 15:41:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: YVETTE TRZCINSKI - YVEWAU

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10618317-4271110&lid=10618317&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	slider press Crowncork seal\Circulating System [PCA05933046] 22 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

