
UNKNOWNOIL ANALYSIS REPORT

Machine Id

511027-1360
Component

Diesel Engine
Fluid

PETRO CANADA DURON SHP 15W40 (--- GAL)

Report Id: GFL622 [WUSCAR] 05942858 (Generated: 09/06/2023 15:17:55) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

Sample is currently in the laboratory

Page 1 of 2



Sample is currently in the laboratory

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : GFL0090453

Lab Number : 05942858

Unique Number : 10633470

Test Package : FLEET

Received : 05 Sep 2023

Diagnosed : 

Diagnostician : 

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

GFL Environmental - 622 - Traverse City Hauling

160 Hughes Dr

Traverse City, MI

US  49686

Contact: GARY BREWER

T: 

F: 

Report Id: GFL622 [WUSCAR] 05942858 (Generated: 09/06/2023 15:17:55) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

Page 2 of 2
Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10633470-3561960&lid=10633470&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	KENWORTH 511027-1360\Diesel Engine [GFL0090453] 01 Sep 2023 @ 7485.0 hrs

