
Sample Rating Trend

FUELCOOLANT REPORT

Machine Id

326725
Component

Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)
Fluid

DEF (Diesel Exaust Fluid) (--- QTS)

 DIAGNOSIS

Recommendation

We advise that you check for the source of

gasoline. Recommend drain diesel exhaust fluid

(def) if not already done and flush before refilling

with diesel exhaust fluid (def). Please note that the

diesel exhaust fluid (def) was too contaminated to

perform the normal laboratory tests.

Contamination

Sample consists entirely of gasoline.

Fluid Condition

The diesel exhaust fluid (def) is no longer

serviceable due to the presence of contaminants.

Report Id: MILPHINE [WUSCAR] 06095965 (Generated: 03/01/2024 10:59:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROSTY VITER - MILPHINE

 SAMPLE INFORMATION method limit/base current history1 history2

Sample Number Client Info PCA0114578 --- ---

Sample Date Client Info 12 Feb 2024 --- ---

Machine Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Age mls Client Info 0 --- ---

Oil Changed Client Info N/A --- ---

Sample Status SEVERE --- ---

 VISUAL method limit/base current history1 history2

Color no image no image no image

Bottom no image no image no image

Page 1 of 2



COOLANT REPORT

Laboratory : WearCheck USA - 501 Madison Ave., Cary, NC 27513

Sample No. : PCA0114578

Lab Number : 06095965

Unique Number : 10888818

Test Package : MOB 1 ( Additional Tests: PERCENTFUEL )

Received : 21 Feb 2024

Tested : 01 Mar 2024

Diagnosed : 01 Mar 2024 - Doug Bogart

To discuss this sample report, contact Customer Service at 1-800-237-1369.

* - Denotes test methods that are outside of the ISO 17025 scope of accreditation.

Statements of conformity to specifications are based on the simple acceptance decision rule (JCGM 106:2012)

MILLER TRUCK LEASING #118

2196 BENNETT ROAD

PHILADELPHIA, PA

US  19116

Contact: ROSTY VITER

rviter@millertransgroup.com

T: (215)552-9832

F: (215)552-9892

Report Id: MILPHINE [WUSCAR] 06095965 (Generated: 03/01/2024 10:59:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROSTY VITER - MILPHINE

 GRAPHS

Sample Color & Clarity

Report Id: MILPHINE [WUSCAR] 06095965 (Generated: 03/01/2024 10:59:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROSTY VITER - MILPHINE

Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.oilanalysis.net/CommonFiles/Reports/default/SR-GENERATE.php?ss=L-10888818-4381584&lid=10888818&oem_template=LUBE360
http://www.tcpdf.org

	326725\Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF) [PCA0114578] 12 Feb 2024 @ .0 hrs

