
VOLVO EC460BLC 10016 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: WC661035
Oil Type: SAE 80W90
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT4535 LOUIS B MAYERLAVAL, QCCA  H7P 6B5Contact: Marco Casturamcastura@strongco.comT: F: (450)686-0703
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe component. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: SHEBAIUnique No: 1981627Signed:Report Date: 03 May 2005
Report Id: SHEBAI [WCAMIS] 01203434 (Generated: 09/19/2023 08:31:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Marco Castura - SHEBAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC661035 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2005 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6837 --- --- ---Oil Hours 200 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 97.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 70 --- --- ---Copper ppm 14 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 19 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 107 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 757 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 92 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEBAI [WCAMIS] 01203434 (Generated: 09/19/2023 08:31:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Marco Castura - SHEBAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC460BLC 10016\Swing Drive [WC661035] 29 Apr 2005 @ 6837.0 hrs

