
VOLVO EC140 3159 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP53468
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Theiron level is marginal. The chromiumlevel is marginal. Gear wear isindicated. There is a moderateconcentration of dirt present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 2306686Signed:Report Date: 15 Sep 2006
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 01328322 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:19:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP53468 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2006 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6633 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 102 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 188 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 8 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 874 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 24 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 55 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 27 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1197 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 243 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 01328322 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:19:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC140 3159\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP53468] 12 Sep 2006 @ 6633.0 hrs

