
VOLVO EC140 3159 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP53463
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Please specify thebrand, type, and viscosity of the oilon your next sample.The iron level ismarginal. The chromium level ismarginal. Gear wear is indicated. Thealuminum level is abnormal. Highconcentration of dirt present in theoil. Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 2306687Signed:Report Date: 15 Sep 2006
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 01328323 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:19:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP53463 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2006 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6633 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 103 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 434 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 9 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 20 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 847 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 67 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 14 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 4 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 121 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 29 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 15 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1154 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 266 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 01328323 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:19:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC140 3159\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP53463] 12 Sep 2006 @ 6633.0 hrs

