
VOLVO L120E 64854 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VC345402
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

VILLE DE THETFORD144 RUE NOTRE DAME SUDTHETFORD, QCCA  G8G 5T3Contact: Andre Arevin
T: (418)335-2981F: (418)338-9139
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Theviscosity of the oil is low indicatingeither Viscosity Index(VI) Improversshearing, or the addition of a lightergrade oil.

Depot: VILTHEUnique No: 2841139Signed:Report Date: 12 Feb 2009
Report Id: VILTHE [WCAMIS] 01519636 (Generated: 08/14/2023 13:16:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andre Arevin - VILTHE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC345402 VC341052 VC341043 VC355620Sample Date 02 Feb 2009 05 Jan 2009 30 Jul 2008 14 Feb 2008Machine Hours 6186 5862 5151 4061Oil Hours 1726 1402 691 2449Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.3 38.2 38.3 40.9
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 424 946 1034 53625Particles >6µm 103 153 141 19696Particles >14µm 14 13 11 540ISO 4406:1999 (c) 16/14/11 17/14/11 17/14/11 23/21/16Silicon ppm 2 3 3 4Sodium ppm 3 5 2 3Potassium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 6 4 10Copper ppm 2 3 2 4Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 4 4 4Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 <1 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 258 322 341 454Magnesium ppm 16 22 24 9Zinc ppm 479 459 471 532Phosphorus ppm 381 369 385 448Barium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Boron ppm 5 6 9 13

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VILTHE [WCAMIS] 01519636 (Generated: 08/14/2023 13:16:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Andre Arevin - VILTHE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120E 64854\Hydraulic System [VC345402] 02 Feb 2009 @ 6186.0 hrs

