
[[519979-01]] VOLVO 6838 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE65917
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 519979-01

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT61 PROGRESS DRIVEORILLIA, ONCA  L3V 6H1Contact: Dan Cowiedcowie@strongco.comT: 1(705)330-0004F: 1(705)330-0007
Diagnosis
We advise that you perform a filterservice, and use off-line filtration toimprove the cleanliness of the systemfluid. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of particulates (5 to 100microns in size) present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: STRORIUnique No: 3120881Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Jun 2010
Report Id: STRORI [WCAMIS] 01613443 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:41:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Cowie - STRORI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE65917 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Jun 2010 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1226 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 16152 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 4429 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 270 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/19/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 46 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 422 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 333 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STRORI [WCAMIS] 01613443 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:41:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Dan Cowie - STRORI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO 6838\Hydraulic System [VCE65917] 04 Jun 2010 @ 1226.0 hrs

