
60536 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE243352
Oil Type: CONOCO PHILLIPS WET BRAKE
Job No:

GREAT WEST EQUIPMENT19067   94TH AVESURREY, BCCA  V4N 3S4Contact: Aaron Iwanowaiwanow@gwequipment.comT: (604)882-5051F: (604)882-9091
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin SAE 20 range, adviseinvestigate. The condition of the fluidis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: MARSURUnique No: 3906061Signed: Bill QuesnelReport Date: 07 Apr 2014
Report Id: MARSUR [WCAMIS] 01907234 (Generated: 11/06/2023 18:39:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Iwanow - MARSUR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE243352 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Mar 2014 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9405 --- --- ---Oil Hours 225 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 56.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.045 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 --- --- ---Copper ppm 60 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2730 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 9 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1176 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 943 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 73 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARSUR [WCAMIS] 01907234 (Generated: 11/06/2023 18:39:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Aaron Iwanow - MARSUR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 60536\Brake Cooling System [VCE243352] 15 Mar 2014 @ 9405.0 hrs

