
VOLVO EC480E 310415 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE225015
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT6171 COLONEL TALBOT ROADLONDON, ONCA  N6P 1J2Contact: Scott Forstersforster@strongco.comT: (519)652-3234F: (519)652-2583
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora new component breaking in. Testsindicate that there is no fuel presentin the oil. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin SAE 10W30 range, adviseinvestigate. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SHELONUnique No: 4485890Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 20 Apr 2017
Report Id: SHELON [WCAMIS] 02139497 (Generated: 07/27/2023 11:49:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Scott Forster - SHELON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE225015 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Apr 2017 --- --- ---Machine Hours 524 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 87.5 --- --- ---Visc @ 100°C cSt 12.5 --- --- ---Viscosity Index (VI) Scale 139 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 0.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 580 --- --- ---Lead ppm 18 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 9 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2084 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 149 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1106 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 897 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHELON [WCAMIS] 02139497 (Generated: 07/27/2023 11:49:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Scott Forster - SHELON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 310415\Diesel Engine [VCE225015] 05 Apr 2017 @ 524.0 hrs

