
[[158596]] VOLVO A25E 73627 - COOLANT

Sample No: WC203701
Oil Type: EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
Job No: 158596

STRONGCO INC1730 RUE DE L`HYDROVAL D`OR, QCCA  J9P 6Z2Contact: Pierre Gauthierpgauthier@strongco.comT: F: (819)825-1360
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thesystem and refill with a 50/50 long-life coolant/water mixture. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All metal levels are normalindicating no corrosion in the coolingsystem. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecoolant is cloudy indicating either anoverconcentration of coolantadditives, or a mixing of incompatiblecoolant technologies. The nitrite levelis acceptable. The pH level of thisfluid is within the acceptable limits.The reserve alkalinity of this fluid isacceptable.

Depot: VOLVO0229Unique No: 4718067Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 09 Jul 2018
Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02226918 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:36:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Pierre Gauthier - VOLVO0229

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC203701 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Mar 2018 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12275 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONBoron ppm 54 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm <1 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2419 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 228 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 29 --- --- ---pH Scale 0-14 8.18 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 3.6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 520 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 50.0 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -37 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONMagnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Calcium ppm 20 --- --- ---Coolant Appearance Cloudy --- --- ---Coolant Color Orange --- --- ---Sand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar NONE --- --- ---
 CORROSIONIron ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0229 [WCAMIS] 02226918 (Generated: 09/28/2023 15:36:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Pierre Gauthier - VOLVO0229
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25E 73627\Coolant [WC203701] 01 Mar 2018 @ 12275.0 hrs

