
[[8000190069]] VOLVO EC250EL 310118 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP231776
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 8000190069

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Viscosityof sample indicates oil is within SAE90W140 range, advise investigate.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 4835900Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 13 Mar 2019
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02272664 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:27:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP231776 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Mar 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2007 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 311 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 509 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 17 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 26 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSPQ 652 --- --- ---Iron ppm 1795 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 88 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 21 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 5 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 19 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 34 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 943 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 114 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02272664 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:27:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250EL 310118\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP231776] 05 Mar 2019 @ 2007.0 hrs

