
[[203348]] VOLVO ECR145E 311798 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP243297
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 203348

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample.{not applicable}There is a moderate concentration ofBacteria, Yeast and Fungus present inthe sample. {not applicable}

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 4887630Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 25 Jun 2019
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02292364 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:26:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP243297 --- --- ---Sample Date 07 Jun 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 184 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 23 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 3.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.004 --- --- ---Bacteria CFU/ml 10000 --- --- ---Yeast CFU/ml 0 --- --- ---Mold Colonies LIGHT --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02292364 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:26:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 311798\Diesel Fuel [VCP243297] 07 Jun 2019 @ 184.0 hrs

