
[[213699]] VOLVO DD120C 288061 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP244024
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 213699

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Lucas Slusarenkolslusarenko@strongco.comT: F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
We advise that you filter this fluidbefore use.{not applicable} ISOCleanliness Code (ISO 4406:1999):22/20/16; Cumulative particle counts>4µm = 36423, >6µm = 8441,>14µm = 609, >21µm = 242, >38µm= 13, >71µm = 1. The water contentis negligible. Flash Point is withacceptable limits. Not enough samplesubmitted to determine fuelcondition and/or classification.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 4929884Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 27 Sep 2019
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02310599 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:25:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lucas Slusarenko - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP244024 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Sep 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 895 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 10 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.001 --- --- ---Bacteria CFU/ml 0 --- --- ---Yeast CFU/ml 0 --- --- ---Mold Colonies NONE --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02310599 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:25:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lucas Slusarenko - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO DD120C 288061\Diesel Fuel [VCP244024] 16 Sep 2019 @ 895.0 hrs

