
VOLVO G720B 40727 - DIFFERENTIAL

Sample No: WC0306899
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT655 MOUNTDALE AVENUETHUNDER BAY, ONCA  P7E 6E5Contact: Sherrie RenaudSRenaud@strongco.comT: (807)475-3052F: (807)473-0921
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CHATHUUnique No: 4956070Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 19 Nov 2019
Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02320775 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:40:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sherrie Renaud - CHATHU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC0306899 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Nov 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5954 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 129 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 32 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 398 --- --- ---Copper ppm 79 --- --- ---Lead ppm 27 --- --- ---Tin ppm 9 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 516 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 218 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1053 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 153 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02320775 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:40:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Sherrie Renaud - CHATHU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G720B 40727\Differential [WC0306899] 15 Nov 2019 @ 5954.0 hrs

