
VOLVO EC300EL 312491 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCE202867
Oil Type: VOLVO
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC. - MOUNT PEARL54 GLENCO DRIVEMOUNT PEARL, NLCA  A1N 4S9Contact: Jeff Hillierjhillier@strongco.comT: (709)747-4026F: (709)747-4059
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: STRMOUUnique No: 4990786Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 14 Jan 2020
Report Id: STRMOU [WCAMIS] 02331480 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:09:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jeff Hillier - STRMOU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE202867 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Dec 2019 --- --- ---Machine Hours 210 --- --- ---Oil Hours 210 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 181 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 725 --- --- ---Copper ppm 15 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 17 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 379 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STRMOU [WCAMIS] 02331480 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:09:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jeff Hillier - STRMOU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300EL 312491\Swing Drive [VCE202867] 24 Dec 2019 @ 210.0 hrs

