
VOLVO L45B 1952243 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP086943
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. Elemental level of silicon (Si)above normal indicating ingress ofseal material. The condition of the oilis acceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 4997969Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 28 Oct 2009
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 02508190 (Generated: 05/17/2024 14:55:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP086943 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 Oct 2009 --- --- ---Machine Hours 343 --- --- ---Oil Hours 343 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 72.31 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 2.73 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 51 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 111 --- --- ---Copper ppm 12 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 4 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 14 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3042 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 8 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1370 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1218 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 84 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 02508190 (Generated: 05/17/2024 14:55:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L45B 1952243\Rear Axle [VCP086943] 22 Oct 2009 @ 343.0 hrs

