
VOLVO A40G VR205 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: WC0306908
Oil Type: FUCHS RENOLIN B 15 VG46
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT655 MOUNTDALE AVENUETHUNDER BAY, ONCA  P7E 6E5Contact: Jean-Luc Antierjantier@strongco.comT: (807)475-3052F: (807)473-0921
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please contact yourrepresentative for informationregarding the proper sampling kitsfor your service. NOTE:  Werecommend using MOB 2 test kits,this testkit includes Particle Count todetermine the ISO cleanliness of thefluid.All component wear rates arenormal. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in thecomponent(unconfirmed). Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CHATHUUnique No: 5006752Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Feb 2020
Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02339333 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:37:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC0306908 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Feb 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 6464 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.003 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 255 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 475 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 377 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02339333 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:38:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G VR205\Hydraulic System [WC0306908] 18 Feb 2020 @ .0 hrs

