
[[8000231988]] VOLVO EC300DL 210165 - DIESEL ENGINESample No: VCP252076
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3

ENVIREM ORGANICS INC.P.O. BOX 3509, STATION BFREDERICTON, NBCA  E3A 5J8Contact: Jim Barnetjimb@envirem.comT: (506)627-1222F: (506)453-1332
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ENV180FREUnique No: 5006926Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Feb 2020
Report Id: ENV180FRE [WCAMIS] 02339507 (Generated: 05/28/2024 12:40:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jim Barnet - ENV180FRE

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP252076 WC252072 VCE116460 VCP242697Sample Date 18 Feb 2020 05 Feb 2020 09 Sep 2019 19 Apr 2019Machine Hours 0 9984 9538 8795Oil Hours 0 0 500 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 13.2 13.2 15.9 14.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g --- 9.42 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 80 97 98
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0 0.2 1.6 0.6Nitration (PA) % 49 63 97 86Sulfation (PA) % 71 72 80 70Glycol % NEG 0.0 NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 10 21 6 7Sodium ppm 2 9 21 11Potassium ppm 4 25 1 <1
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 11 39 39 24Copper ppm 2 15 2 2Lead ppm <1 2 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 2 1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 6 4 4Chromium ppm <1 3 1 1Molybdenum ppm 41 41 39 41Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 1676 1956 1883 1782Magnesium ppm 505 456 476 492Zinc ppm 885 942 991 925Phosphorus ppm 778 807 811 769Barium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Boron ppm 65 81 33 38 Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ENV180FRE [WCAMIS] 02339507 (Generated: 05/28/2024 12:40:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jim Barnet - ENV180FRE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300DL 210165\Diesel Engine [VCP252076] 18 Feb 2020 @ .0 hrs

