
[[8000240968]] CATERPILLAR 980H 6490 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP260227
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER TRANSMISSION OIL SAE 30
Job No: 8000240968

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Lindsay Downsldowns@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5045481Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 14 May 2020
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02354049 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:58:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP260227 VCP251232 VCP260747 VCP222996Sample Date 09 May 2020 27 Dec 2019 20 Nov 2019 13 Jun 2019Machine Hours 13928 13546 13296 11974Oil Hours 2000 0 0 499Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 101 103 103 102
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 10 9 8 8Sodium ppm <1 <1 1 2Potassium ppm <1 <1 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 127 103 93 57Copper ppm 12 11 11 8Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 4 4 3 3Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 0 <1Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3199 3168 3218 3248Magnesium ppm 10 10 10 11Zinc ppm 1286 1311 1335 1323Phosphorus ppm 1057 1092 1084 1048Barium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Boron ppm <1 <1 1 <1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02354049 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:58:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 980H 6490\Front Axle [VCP260227] 09 May 2020 @ 13928.0 hrs

