
[[8000247231]] CATERPILLAR 980H 6490 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP252371
Oil Type: MOBIL 1 SAE 10W30
Job No: 8000247231

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT INC.55 ISNOR DRIVE, BURNSIDE INDUSTRIALPARKDARTMOUTH, NSCA  B3B 1N6Contact: Lindsay Downsldowns@strongco.comT: (902)468-5010F: (902)468-2468
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SHEDARUnique No: 5068617Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Jun 2020
Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02361173 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:58:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP252371 VCP251024 VCP251141 VCP222898Sample Date 18 Jun 2020 09 May 2020 20 Nov 2019 13 Jun 2019Machine Hours 14263 13928 13296 11974Oil Hours 965 632 0 284Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.8 10.9 10.7 10.8Oxidation (PA) % 80 82 75 81
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.1 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 68 72 64 59Sulfation (PA) % 77 75 68 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 13 7 8 47Sodium ppm 2 2 1 3Potassium ppm 2 1 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 49 11 16 10Copper ppm 5 12 4 20Lead ppm <1 1 <1 1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 3 <1 1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 31 33 29 34Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1624 1683 1756 1663Magnesium ppm 426 436 382 430Zinc ppm 900 915 906 1068Phosphorus ppm 768 783 751 876Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 58 66 58 67

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHEDAR [WCAMIS] 02361173 (Generated: 09/28/2023 08:58:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Lindsay Downs - SHEDAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR 980H 6490\Diesel Engine [VCP252371] 18 Jun 2020 @ 14263.0 hrs

