
[[247875]] VOLVO EC220E 310188 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP272833
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 247875

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT--CALGARY7923 54TH STREET SECALGARY, ABCA  T2C 4R7Contact: Tracey Lewintlewin@strongco.comT: (403)216-1010F: (403)216-1016
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3909Unique No: 5069014Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 25 Jun 2020
Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02361570 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:20:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP272833 VCP260691 VCP260482 VCP250019Sample Date 24 Jun 2020 30 Mar 2020 17 Dec 2019 09 Sep 2019Machine Hours 4554 4011 3515 2989Oil Hours 500 0 0 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.7 14.0 14.1Oxidation (PA) % 78 57 70 69
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 0 0.1 0Nitration (PA) % 59 61 60 61Sulfation (PA) % 75 64 68 64Glycol % NEG NEG 0.0 0.0Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 4 3 3Sodium ppm 2 2 <1 <1Potassium ppm <1 2 7 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 3 6 6Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 1 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 35 15 9 6Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1624 1463 2096 2208Magnesium ppm 531 659 120 73Zinc ppm 890 829 1081 1142Phosphorus ppm 774 737 935 968Barium ppm <1 3 0 <1Boron ppm 54 80 142 143

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3909 [WCAMIS] 02361570 (Generated: 09/28/2023 09:20:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Tracey Lewin - VOLVO3909
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 310188\Diesel Engine [VCP272833] 24 Jun 2020 @ 4554.0 hrs

