
VOLVO A30G 742568 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP273097
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Matt Criscimcrisci@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. No other correctiveaction is recommended at thistime.All component wear rates arenormal. Light fuel dilution occurring.No other contaminants weredetected in the oil. The condition ofthe oil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5094532Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Aug 2020
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02371084 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:34:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP273097 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Jul 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1500 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 72 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 76 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 2.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 9 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 92 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1948 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 92 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1063 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 867 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 75 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02371084 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:34:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742568\Diesel Engine [VCP273097] 29 Jul 2020 @ 1500.0 hrs

