
VOLVO EC200E VOLVOEC200E - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: WC0443925
Oil Type: DIESEL FUEL No. 2
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT655 MOUNTDALE AVENUETHUNDER BAY, ONCA  P7E 6E5Contact: Jean-Luc Antierjantier@strongco.comT: (807)475-3052F: (807)473-0921
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. We advise thatyou check all areas wherecontaminants can enter the system.We advise that you follow the  waterdrain-off procedure for thiscomponent.{not applicable} There is ahigh concentration of Bacteria,  Yeastand Fungus present in the sample.  Test for H2O indicates sample 100%water. The fuel is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: CHATHUUnique No: 5096527Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 02 Sep 2020
Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02373079 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:33:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC0443925 --- --- ---Sample Date 25 Aug 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 0.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1000000 --- --- ---Bacteria CFU/ml 100000 --- --- ---Yeast CFU/ml 1000000 --- --- ---Mold Colonies NONE --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02373079 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:33:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC200E VOLVOEC200E\Diesel Fuel [WC0443925] 25 Aug 2020 @ .0 hrs

