
[[252821]] VOLVO L90C 62496 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE146300
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 252821

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-GRANDE PRAIRIE11301 - 89TH AVE.GRANDE PRAIRIE, ABCA  T8V 7M9Contact: Alexander Ellaell@strongco.comT: (780)513-3700F: (780)513-8822
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: STRGRAUnique No: 5097901Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 08 Sep 2020
Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02374453 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:46:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE146300 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Sep 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8528 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 14.7 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 55 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 59 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 52 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1240 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 730 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 814 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 731 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 83 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02374453 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:46:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90C 62496\Diesel Engine [VCE146300] 02 Sep 2020 @ 8528.0 hrs

