
[[252821]] VOLVO L90C 62496 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCE146301
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: 252821

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-GRANDE PRAIRIE11301 - 89TH AVE.GRANDE PRAIRIE, ABCA  T8V 7M9Contact: Alexander Ellaell@strongco.comT: (780)513-3700F: (780)513-8822
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. The fluid was not specified,however, a fluid match indicates thatthis fluid is (GENERIC) AWHYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46.  Pleaseconfirm. All component wear rates are normal.Particles >4µm are abnormally high.Particles >6µm are abnormally high.Particles >14µm are notably high.Particles >21µm are notably high.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: STRGRAUnique No: 5097952Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 09 Sep 2020
Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02374504 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:46:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE146301 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Sep 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8528 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.6 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 30204 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 3469 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 216 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/15 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 2 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 130 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 325 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 293 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02374504 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:46:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90C 62496\Hydraulic System [VCE146301] 02 Sep 2020 @ 8528.0 hrs

