
VOLVO ECR235CL 110174 - PUMP

Sample No: VC464435
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No:

DAYTON CONSTRUCTION146 BUNKER HILL ROADWATERTOWN, CTUS  06795Contact: SERVICE MANAGER
T: (860)274-2998F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: DAYWATUnique No: 5144086Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 26 Mar 2010
Report Id: DAYWAT [WUSCAR] 02599156 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:31:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - DAYWAT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VC464435 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Mar 2010 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1058 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1058 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.33 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 100 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 581 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 470 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DAYWAT [WUSCAR] 02599156 (Generated: 07/06/2023 09:31:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SERVICE MANAGER - DAYWAT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235CL 110174\Pump [VC464435] 08 Mar 2010 @ 1058.0 hrs

