
[[264703]] VOLVO EC210B 10156 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP275305
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 264703

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Matt Criscimcrisci@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend you service the filters onthis component. Confirm the sourceof the lubricant being utilized for top-up/fill. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Water Water and ppmwater and ppm water contaminationlevels are abnormal. Particles >4µmare abnormally high. Particles >6µmare notably high. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5146846Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Dec 2020
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02391388 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:27:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP275305 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Nov 2020 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10888 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.470 --- --- ---Particles >4µm 103197 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 16385 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 156 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 21 --- --- ---Copper ppm 64 --- --- ---Lead ppm 4 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1856 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 35 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1072 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 945 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 13 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02391388 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:27:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Matt Crisci - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC210B 10156\Hydraulic System [VCP275305] 17 Nov 2020 @ 10888.0 hrs

