
[ARC TRADES [280137]] VOLVO ECR305 6913 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP274443
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 280137

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jonathan Mortonjmorton@strongco.comT: (780)464-1909F: (780)464-0434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 80 WetBrake Transaxle Oil.  Please confirmthe oil type and grade, and specifythe brand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5214222Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 03 May 2021
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02418737 (Generated: 09/28/2023 13:31:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP274443 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Apr 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8092 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 55.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 200 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 11 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 12 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 346 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 31 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 6 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3396 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 17 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1358 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1097 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 105 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02418737 (Generated: 09/28/2023 13:31:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305 6913\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP274443] 08 Apr 2021 @ 8092.0 hrs

