
ALLIED HR60 2020552 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: WC0589145
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 22
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT255 BAIG BOULEVARDMONCTON, NBCA  E1E 1E1Contact: Greg Wardgward@strongco.comT: (506)857-8425F: (506)857-0851
Diagnosis
Check seals and/or filters for pointsof contaminant entry. The airbreather requires service.  If unrated,we recommend that you replace witha suitable micron rated and/ordesiccant air breather.  If rated, werecommend that you service/replacethe breather. We recommend youservice the filters on this component.Resample in 30-45 days to monitorthis situation. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 22.  Pleaseconfirm.All component wear rates arenormal. Particles >4µm are severelyhigh. Particles >6µm are abnormallyhigh. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: SHE255MONUnique No: 5229252Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Jun 2021
Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02425752 (Generated: 09/19/2023 08:37:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Greg Ward - SHE255MON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number WC0589145 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Jun 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 22.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 47640 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 3910 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 98 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/19/14 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 36 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 374 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 305 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SHE255MON [WCAMIS] 02425752 (Generated: 09/19/2023 08:38:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Greg Ward - SHE255MON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALLIED ALLIED HR60 2020552\Hydraulic System [WC0589145] 02 Jun 2021 @ 10.0 hrs

