
NO UNIT INFO PROVIDED - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 30
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT655 MOUNTDALE AVENUETHUNDER BAY, ONCA  P7E 6E5Contact: Jean-Luc Antierjantier@strongco.comT: (807)475-3052F: (807)473-0921
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition. No other corrective actionis recommended at this time. Thefluid was not specified, however, afluid match indicates that this fluid is(GENERIC) DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE30.  Please confirm.  Please specifythe component make and model withyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. Light fuel dilutionoccurring. There is a moderateconcentration of water present in theoil. Test for glycol is negative. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: CHATHUUnique No: 5305747Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 09 Nov 2021
Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02454209 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:28:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Nov 2021 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 85 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.655 --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 91 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % 0.0 --- --- ---Fuel % 1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 36 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1796 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 503 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1190 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 981 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 28 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CHATHU [WCAMIS] 02454209 (Generated: 09/19/2023 11:28:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jean-Luc Antier - CHATHU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT INFO PROVIDED\Diesel Engine [VCP] 04 Nov 2021 @ .0 hrs

