
[[322756]] VOLVO ECR145E 315109 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP333555
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 322756

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Villamor Pingolvpingol@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
Confirm the source of the lubricantbeing utilized for top-up/fill.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Metal levels are typical fora components first oil change. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. Additive levels indicate theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5399009Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 20 May 2022
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02490071 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:34:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP333555 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 May 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 413 --- --- ---Oil Hours 413 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 136 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 382 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 24 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 40 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 31 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 389 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02490071 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:34:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR145E 315109\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP333555] 02 May 2022 @ 413.0 hrs

