
[[314854]] VOLVO G740-VHP 33526 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP349537
Oil Type: CASTROL HVI 32
Job No: 314854

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jonathan Mortonjmorton@strongco.comT: (780)464-1909F: (780)464-0434
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Particles >6µm and oilcleanliness are abnormally high. Thesystem cleanliness is above theacceptable limit for the target ISO4406 cleanliness code. The oil is stillserviceable provided that thecontaminant(s) can be reduced toacceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5410027Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 08 Jun 2022
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02493068 (Generated: 09/28/2023 11:30:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP349537 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 May 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12410 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 31.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 98076 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 10380 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 29 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/12 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 10 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 90 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 432 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 404 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02493068 (Generated: 09/28/2023 11:30:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jonathan Morton - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO G740-VHP 33526\Hydraulic System [VCP349537] 27 May 2022 @ 12410.0 hrs

