
[[327210]] VOLVO EC480E 314662 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP297761
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 327210

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-EDMONTON25616 117 Ave NWAcheson, ABCA  T7X 6C2Contact: Jason Sweetjsweet@strongco.comT: PhoneF: (780)417-2615
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO3908Unique No: 5421765Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 Jun 2022
Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02496805 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:12:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Sweet - VOLVO3908

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP297761 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Jun 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1272 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1272 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 12705 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 321 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 7 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/16/10 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 110 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 502 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 392 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm <1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3908 [WCAMIS] 02496805 (Generated: 09/28/2023 10:12:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Jason Sweet - VOLVO3908
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314662\Hydraulic System [VCP297761] 08 Jun 2022 @ 1272.0 hrs

