
NO UNIT VCP297912 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP297912
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Villamor Pingolvpingol@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Thefluid was not specified, however, afluid match indicates that this fluid isSAE 10W AW Hydraulic Oil.  Pleaseconfirm the oil type and grade, andspecify the brand of the oil on yournext sample. Please specify thecomponent make and model withyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is a lightamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5435501Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 02 Aug 2022
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502540 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:29:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP297912 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jul 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 34.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 8806 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 896 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 68 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/17/13 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 7 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 --- --- ---Copper ppm 6 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 82 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 13 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 416 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 332 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502540 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:29:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT VCP297912\Hydraulic System [VCP297912] 28 Jul 2022 @ .0 hrs

