
NO UNIT VCP297914 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP297614
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Villamor Pingolvpingol@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify thecomponent make and model withyour next sample. Please specify thebrand, type, and viscosity of the oilon your next sample.All componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe fluid. The condition of the fluid isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5435539Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 29 Jul 2022
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502578 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:30:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP297614 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Jul 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 32.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 50 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 377 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 203 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 294 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 413 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 75 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502578 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:30:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NO UNIT VCP297914\Transmission [VCP297614] 28 Jul 2022 @ .0 hrs

