
[[330296]] VOLVO EC250E 314186 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP349660
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 330296

Strongco Equipment5179 Fountain St N.Breslau, ONCA  N0B 1M0Contact: Villamor Pingolvpingol@strongco.comT: (519)744-3518F: (519)744-3284
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CASKITUnique No: 5435571Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 Jul 2022
Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502610 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:31:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP349660 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jul 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1100 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 139 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 224 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 165 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 81 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 849 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 121 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CASKIT [WCAMIS] 02502610 (Generated: 09/19/2023 13:31:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Villamor Pingol - CASKIT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 314186\Swing Drive [VCP349660] 05 Jul 2022 @ 1100.0 hrs

