
VOLVO L120E 64932 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCE55863
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No:

STRONGCO EQUIPMENT-GRANDE PRAIRIE11301 - 89TH AVE.GRANDE PRAIRIE, ABCA  T8V 7M9Contact: Alexander Ellaell@strongco.comT: (780)513-3700F: (780)513-8822
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DEXRON III.  Please confirm.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: STRGRAUnique No: 5488252Signed: Kevin MarsonReport Date: 18 Nov 2022
Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02523271 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:31:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE55863 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Nov 2022 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9514 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 41 --- --- ---Copper ppm 16 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 62 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 187 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 85 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: STRGRA [WCAMIS] 02523271 (Generated: 09/28/2023 14:31:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Alexander Ell - STRGRA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120E 64932\Transmission (Auto) [VCE55863] 15 Nov 2022 @ 9514.0 hrs

